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Orquidea Residences
Price:  USD 1.250.000 (AWG 2.225.000)

Location:  Noord

Bathrooms:  3.5

Bedrooms:  3

Sustainable Luxury Living in a Secure Gated Community Discover 
the perfect balance of modern luxury and eco-conscious living in 
this exclusive gated community. Designed with sustainability in 
mind, this thoughtfully planned development features a mix of 
energy-efficient condos and villas, each equipped with state-of-the-
art green technologies to promote a healthier, environmentally 
responsible lifestyle. Each villa is designed for maximum efficiency, 
featuring solar panels, thermal insulation, inverter A/C units, and 
double-glass doors and windows to optimize energy use and 
climate control. To ensure a safe, toxin-free environment, all homes 
are finished with mineral-based, chemical-free paint. Additionally, 
most villas boast a private pool, offering a personal retreat in your 
own backyard, and are equipped with pneumatic vacuum elevators 
for enhanced accessibility and modern convenience. Villas start at 
$1,250,000, offering an unparalleled combination of sustainability 
and luxury. Furniture packages are also available, making your 
move-in process effortless and seamless. A Community Designed 
for Sustainable Comfort & Elegance ✔ Eco-friendly innovations – 
Treated sewage systems for plant irrigation, solar-powered street 
lamps, LED lighting, and pneumatic vacuum elevators for a greener 
future. ✔ Sustainable infrastructure – Beautifully designed paver 
roads, a smart irrigation system, and lush green spaces that 
enhance both aesthetics and environmental responsibility. ✔ Resort-
style amenities – A clubhouse with a meeting space, a roof deck 
lounge, a large community pool, an outdoor shower, and a BBQ 
area, creating the ultimate space for entertainment and relaxation. ✔ 
Health & wellness focus – Stay active with a modern gym, a play 
garden, and scenic outdoor spaces designed for recreation and 
leisure. ✔ Convenience & security – Enjoy concierge services, 
wheelchair-accessible pathways, 24/7 security surveillance, 
professional property management, and an optional rental 
program, ensuring a worry-free lifestyle. Live in a secure, 
sustainable, and luxurious community built for the future. Whether 
you're looking for a dream home or a smart investment, this earth-
friendly development offers the perfect blend of comfort, 
innovation, and environmental responsibility. �� Step into the future 
of eco-luxury living—contact us today! ��
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